
From: Indian Journal of Public Health Research & Development <editor.ijphrd@gmail.com> 

Date: 9/25/18 5:22 PM (GMT+08:00) 
To: Rudy Hartono <dinomks70@gmail.com> 
Subject: Re: Ask about journal Fee 
 

If you submit your article now then it will be slated for publication in May 2020 issue. 
Latest issue is November issue 2018 for which you have to opt for fast track 
publication (charges for fast track is 200 USD per article). 
 
On Tue, Sep 25, 2018 at 1:59 PM, Rudy Hartono <dinomks70@gmail.com> wrote: 
 

Thank you for your response 
 
When is the latest volume will be released in case if I submitted it now. 

 
Best regard, 
 
Rudy Hartono 
 
On Tue, 25 Sep 2018 at 15:33, Indian Journal of Public Health Research & Development 

<editor.ijphrd@gmail.com> wrote: 

Charges are 100 USD per article 

once the article gets accepted only after that you will be  asked to pay the manuscript 

handling charges within the email you will be notify the payment mode. 

On Tue, Sep 25, 2018 at 12:38 PM, Rudy Hartono <dinomks70@gmail.com> wrote: 
 

Thank you for your response.  

Rudy Hartono1, Agustian Ipa1, Aswita Amir1, Bambang Wirjatmadi2 , Ridho Pratama1, Ronny 

Horax3 

1Health Polytechnic of Ministry of Health in Makassar, Indonesia 
2Professor of community nutrition, Public Health Faculty, Airlangga University, Indonesia 
3Department of Food Science University of Arkansas , USA 

 

Best regard, 
 

Rudy Hartono 

 
On Tue, 25 Sep 2018 at 14:54, Indian Journal of Public Health Research & 
Development <editor.ijphrd@gmail.com> wrote: 

Write complete author details,  Affiliation (designations with college address) 

with warm regards 
 
Yours sincerely 
 
Vidya Surwade 
Associate Professor, Dr Baba Saheb Ambedkar,Medical College & Hospital 
Rohinee,Delhi 
www.ijphrd.com 
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On Tue, Sep 25, 2018 at 12:07 PM, Rudy Hartono<dinomks70@gmail.com> wrote: 
 

Hi there,  
 
I interested to submit my journal here. Could you please explain about submission 
fee and the submission flow to this journal. 
Should I Pay first or after review? 
Our journal have 6 pages without color  
 
Best Regard, 
 
Rudy Hartono 
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